
 Thank you for coming to this presentation today. I am Takuma Matsushita, the CFO. 

 I will talk about the JR Kyushu Group’s ESG initiatives. 

 Please turn to the next slide. 



 I will talk about these four points. The first point is the JR Kyushu Group’s approach to 
ESG management. The other points are about specific initiatives related to ESG. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 This illustrates our management philosophy. 

 Based on the three pillars of “Integrity,” “Growth and Evolution,” and “Local 
Community Invigoration,” the JR Kyushu Group aims to achieve its view of what we 
aim to be. 

 To realize what we aim to be, we have set forth our 2030 Long-term Vision and two 
policies for realizing this vision, while identifying material issues. 

 The JR Kyushu Group Medium-term Business Plan 2022-2024 is positioned as an 
important stage for returning to a growth track, and by repeating our value creation 
process, we will strive to realize our long-term vision and what we aim to be in a bid 
to sustain growth. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 This is our value creation process. 

 The Group uses various capital to run its businesses while leveraging its strengths in 
five segments with the objective of improving both economic and social value. 

 The Group has identified material issues as points that the JR Kyushu Group focuses 
on at all times. By going through our value creation process, we aim to solve material 
issues, further increase our corporate value and help realize a sustainable society. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Next, I will talk about material issues and non-financial KPIs. 

 Based on the specific policies for realizing our 2030 Long-Term Vision in our Medium-
term Business Plan, we have reassessed material issues and set non-financial KPIs for 
the environment, society and governance. 

 Among non-financial KPIs, we have linked executive compensation to the results of an 
employee awareness survey. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Here, I discuss specific material issues. 

 The first is the realization of a de-carbonized society. 

 The Group aims to contribute to the de-carbonization of society by providing and 
promoting a seamless mobility centered on the railway business, and to achieve net zero 
emissions of CO2 by 2050 on the way to a de-carbonized society.

 The Group has introduced energy-saving trains and taken other steps toward a 
sustainable environment. 

 In August 2022, we conducted a 1.5°C scenario analysis and disclosed an estimate of the 
amount of financial impact. 

 Based on TCFD recommendations and the results of our scenario analysis, we created a 
roadmap for realizing a de-carbonized society, set non-financial KPIs and set initiatives in 
motion. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Next, I will discuss specific initiatives for realizing a de-carbonized society. 

 First, as an investment that contribute to increase environmental value, JR Kyushu plans 
to invest about ¥60 billion in the project through the green bond framework during the 
current medium-term business plan. 

 In the real estate business, we aim to obtain CASBEE certification for the Kagoshima-
Chuo Station West Entrance Building and the New Nagasaki Station Building. 

 To conserve energy in electricity for operations, we have continued to introduce energy-
saving trains. On the Nishi-Kyushu Shinkansen, which opened in September 2022, the 
latest rolling stock has been introduced, reducing the consumption of electricity 
compared with older kinds of rolling stock for Shinkansen lines. 

 We aim to help solve social issues, such as climate change, through business activities 
and will take advantage of ESG financing to accelerate initiatives for realizing a 
sustainable society. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Here, I will talk about our initiatives for society, starting with safety and services, the 
foundation for all our businesses. 

 Safety and services are the foundation for all our businesses, and remains as important 
as ever. We believe gaining the trust of our customers and all other stakeholders is the 
starting point of all our businesses. 

 The Group believes in ensuring the mindset that safety requires initiative, and to this 
end, it has established a safety management structure in which the management team is 
primarily involved in its operation.

 Our system for views shared by employees about safety is used to allow employees to 
share opinions and concerns about safety, unsafe incident experiences, and unsafe 
incidents that may occur to prevent accidents and other hazards before they occur. 
Details and solutions are reported to the Executive Committee within two weeks and 
information is shared with all employees via our intranet. 

 All employees, including management, and all Group company employees go through 
training at the Safety Creation Center once every two years. The Center is currently 
conducting a sixth round of training while upgrading the content of training to reflect 
recent risks. In March 2021, the Center underwent a major update, and now features a 
more practical environment for learning. We will continue to train employees so they can 
take action with safety in mind. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Next is services. 

 JR Kyushu listens to its customers to understand their concerns and points of 
dissatisfaction in order to rapidly improve services.

 Customer opinions and requests are reported to and deliberated by the Executive 
Committee as the views of customers for further consideration and action. Customers 
receive replies within two weeks, and their views are shared within the Company and 
incorporated into specific measures for improvement. 

 In an effort to improve service quality, we are ranking our services by asking external 
research firms to evaluate our services. 

 The main point of service rankings is to define on-site employees a starting point. The 
survey results can be used to clarify issues unique to JR Kyushu, and inform 
employees on how to improve services. This has contributed strongly to better 
services for the entire Group. 

 Service rankings represent 90 or more points as a non-financial KPI for services. 

 Please turn to the next page.



 Next, I will discuss sustainable city-building. 

 We approach our business with a strong sense of purpose as a corporate group that is 
invigorating Kyushu. 

 Building cities where people want to live, work and visit is an initiative that the JR 
Kyushu Group can do because it has deep roots in the Kyushu region and grown along 
with the region. 

 We believe local community invigoration means to improve both the economic and 
social value of the region. For example, in the western Kyushu area where the Nishi-
Kyushu Shinkansen opened, we aim to spread the benefits of its opening as widely as 
possible throughout western Kyushu, instead of concentrating it in one area. 

 We believe the JR Kyushu Group’s sustainable growth depends in part on local 
community invigoration through the enhancement of both economic and social value. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Next, I will talk about initiatives in sustainable city-building as it relates to local 
community invigoration. 

 One example of our city-building initiatives is our renovation projects, such as the 
Aburayama Citizens’ Forest, located south of Fukuoka City. 

 As a leading project for Fukuoka Green NEXT in Fukuoka City, this project plans to 
start operations of a restaurant with its own vegetable garden and the forest outdoor 
park, among other facilities, in a partnership with Fukuoka City and other partners. 

 While working for the environment, a recycling-oriented society and de-carbonization, 
we will advance city-building in collaboration with other companies to discover the 
region’s resources and convey their attractiveness to the world. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Next, I will discuss the development of human resources, the source of value creation. 

 Human resources are the source of value creation at JR Kyushu. In addition to efforts 
to develop personnel who take the initiative to learn and take on new challenges, we 
are working to make JR Kyushu a company that is easy and satisfying to work in. 
Creating an environment where diverse personnel can thrive will further increase the 
value of the JR Kyushu Group as a company and lead to sustainable growth.

 Please turn to the next slide.



 JR Kyushu has started to reform its personnel system, the key to developing human 
resources. We are building a new framework for human resource development while 
reviewing our systems and structures for hiring & placement, development and 
evaluation. For example, we have started to revise the wage system, and through 
opportunities to exchange opinions with employees from diverse industries and 
corporate officers in charge of human resources, we are identifying issues and making 
sure we are moving in the right direction. 

 With revisions to the wage system as a starting point, we will reform our personnel 
system in ways that increase the visibility of career paths, support re-skilling, promote 
women’s participation and advancement in the workplace, and strengthen mid-career 
hiring. We aim to maximize the individual capabilities of the diverse employees who 
will support the strategies for achieving our long-term vision. By translating this into 
growth for the Group, we will strive toward what we aim to be. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Here, I will explain initiatives to increase employee engagement. 

 In the awareness survey for the fiscal year ended March 31, 2022, points declined for 
“attractiveness to employees,” and management is highly aware of this problem. 
Employee motivation is the driving force behind an organization and determines the 
effectiveness of strategies. Through events to exchange opinions for all employees, we 
are increasing opportunities for management to directly talk with employees, as we 
believe it is important to improve their understanding of the company’s measures and 
the current situation. 

 We also plan to expand the employee awareness survey to all Group companies next 
fiscal year. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Now I will talk about changes in governance as an initiative for sound corporate 
management. 

 A majority of our directors are independent outside directors, and the ratio of female 
directors is 20%. Our independent outside directors have knowledge in various fields, 
diverse experience and specializations that translate into more insightful discussions at 
Board of Directors meetings. 

 As I previously explained, the employee awareness survey is an important indicator in 
our attempt to quantify the degree that our human resource strategy is being realized. 
Starting this fiscal year, the survey results will be tied to the performance-linked 
compensation of directors. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 Next, I will discuss communications with stakeholders. 

 We believe events like IR Day are very important opportunities to engage in dialogues 
with investors, and we intend to enhance these events in the future. Today, I will talk 
about creating sustainable relationships with regional society. 

 Regional society is an important stakeholder for the JR Kyushu Group. We have 
engaged in business with the intention of collaborating with locals in a variety of fields. 
Prime examples of this are the warm welcomes by residents at stations where the D&S 
trains stop, and along the railways they run on, and the cooperation of local residents 
through participation in the JR Kyushu walking activity. 

 Moreover, local residents are collaborating with us in a variety of ways. Through this 
collaboration, more local residents gain an understanding of JR Kyushu, and we aim to 
deepen our relationship with local residents. 

 Please turn to the next slide.



 I have explained the JR Kyushu Group’s initiatives from an ESG perspective. 

 The Group aims to achieve its vision by improving corporate value and realizing a 
sustainable society as a corporate group that is invigorating Kyushu based on its three 
our code of conduct.

 This concludes my presentation. Thank you for your attention.


